

**OMC PRICE OF CHROME ORE FOR THE PERIOD FROM 08.10.2018 upto 06.11.2018
(AS PER NATIONAL E-AUCTION ON 04.10.2018)**

Mines/ Plant	Grade (Cr203%)	Basis (Cr203%)	Bid Price (e-auction (Rs. /MT)	Price (Rs. /MT) for LTL Buyers.	
South Kaliapani Chromite Mines	.+54%	54%	17007	16933	
			16907		
	52-54	52%	16147	16096	
			16047		
	48-50%	48%	14828	14802	
			14728		
	46-48%	46%	13518	13488	
			13418		
	44-46%	44%	12577	12495	
			12477		
	Sukrangi Chromite Mines	.+54%	54%	16246	16246
		52-54%	52%	15385	15385
50-52%		50%	14637	14637	
48-50%		48%	14795	14795	
46-48%		46%	12333	12333	
44-46%		44%	12740	12740	
42-44%		42%	11547	11507	
			11447		

**OMC PRICE OF CHROME ORE FOR THE PERIOD FROM 07.09.2018 upto 06.11.2018
(AS PER NATIONAL E-AUCTION ON 05.09.2018)**

Bangur Chromite Mines	44-48% Lumps	46%	No bid	9832
	40-44%Lumps	42%	8189	8189
	36-40%Lumps	38%	7618	7618
	32-36%Lumps	34%	No bid	6817
	36-40%Chips	38%	No bid	7618
	(-) 40%Fines	38%	No bid	5431
	40-42%Fines	40%	No bid	5717
	42-44%Fines	42%	6002	6002
	46-48%Fines	46%	7645	7645
	48-50%Fines	48%	8078	8035
			7978	

**OMC PRICE OF IRON ORE (CLO/ LUMP) VALID FROM 06.10.2018 to 04.12.2018
(AS PER NATIONAL E-AUCTION ON 03.10.2018)**

Mines/Plant	Grade (Fe %)	Basis (Fe %)	Bid Price (e-auction)	Price (Rs./MT) for LTL
Daitari	10-40mm, (+62% Fe) B.F. Grade CLO	62% Fe	4,600.00	4,564.00
			4,550.00	
Gandhamardan	10-40mm, (+62% Fe) B.F. Grade CLO	62% Fe	4,100.00	4,100.00
	10-180mm, (+65% Fe) Lump ore	65% Fe	3,400.00	3,400.00
Koira	10-40mm, (+62% Fe)B.F. Grade CLO	62% Fe	4,650.00	4,638.00
			4,600.00	

OMC PRICE OF IRON ORE FINES VALID FROM 10.09.2018 to 08.11.2018

Daitari	64-62% Fe Fines (-10mm)	62% Fe	2,500.00	2,461.00
			2,450.00	
Gandhamardan	60-62% Fe (-10mm)	60% Fe	1,550.00	1,522.00
			1,500.00	
Koira	60-62% Fe (-10mm)	60% Fe	1,300.00	1,256.00
			1,250.00	

OMC PRICE OF GIBBSITIC BAUXITE ORE FINES VALID FROM 05.10.2018 to 04.04.2019

Mines/Plant	Grade (Al ₂ O ₃)	Basis (Al ₂ O ₃)	Bid Price (e-auction (Rs./MT))	Price (Rs./MT) for LTL Buyers.
Kodingamali	38-45% Al ₂ O ₃	40%	558.00	553.00
			548.00	

DR

[Handwritten signature]

[Handwritten signature]